
These are your tasks:

Operator with flexibility talent, hands on
competence, recovery proven to secure
handover/transfer of knowledge to Mexican
stakeholders and knowledge transfer OHSC
Pre/Final Assembly production & inspection
for blue collars in Mexico.

•

Assembly work, carrying out quality
assurance and prepare, execute and
coordinate Assembly process with other
assemblies. 

•

Assemble parts and material and visually
inspect items according to instructions,
working plans and drawings.

•

Check instructions for completeness,
determine material / buy parts and its
availability, retrieve parts and report
shortages.

•

Identify errors, correct defined faults,
inform/report about causes and manage
troubleshooting. 

•

Who we are looking for:

You are trained in the field of production or
have a comparable education and have
professional experience in the desired area.

•

Commitment to Diehl Aviation's
internationalisation strategy and grow.
Passion and engagement to bring cultures
together and solve discrepancies.

•

Willingness to accept new behavior
patterns, tolerance of ambiguity, approach
people without prejudice and flexibility in
cultural driven behaviors, cultural empathy,
interpersonal skills.

•

Start up mentality, hands on competence
and willingness to travel between Mexico
and Germany.

•

Work location:

Job Level:

Working mode:

Working time:

Employment contract:

Division:

Start:

Laupheim

Professional

Hybrid working

Full time

permanent

Diehl Aviation

01.10.2025

Tariff compensa-
tion 

Flexible working
hours 

Family-owned
company 

Internal training
programs 

Employee dis-
counts 

Expat Operator (m/f/d) for Mexico

Applications from severely disabled applicants (m/f/d) will be given preferential treatment if they are equally suitable. Should you wish to do so,
please indicate your SB status - on a voluntary basis - in your application.

These are your potential benefits

makeitworkatdiehl.com

https://makeitworkatdiehl.com/


Diehl Aviation Laupheim GmbH
Magdalena Traub 
Tel: 07392 703-2592

Achieve what matters, with Diehl.

makeitworkatdiehl.com
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